
Experience a Life of Wellness with our Complete Concierge
Solution, Offering You and Your Family Unlimited Access to

Essential Healthcare Services for just $100 a Month!

Adults can choose a provider and get in-depth
consultations for routine care, treatment of
common illnesses, and preventive care. 

(2) Adults can get a Comprehensive
Metabolic Panel to check for conditions like
diabetes, hypertension, liver & kidney disease.

Members age 12 and older can consult with
a dermatologist for treatment and diagnosis
of common skin, nail, and hair conditions.

Enjoy exclusive access to a wide range of
maintenance meds for chronic illnesses at no
cost or save up to 80% off the average cost.

Members age 12 and up can enjoy unlimited
access to immediate support counseling and
short-term solution-focused counseling.

Enjoy exclusive access to the top immediate
need meds for acute illnesses at no cost or
save up to 80% off the average cost.

Virtual 
Primary Care 

Free Annual 
Exam & CMP

Virtual 
Dermatology

Free Chronic
Medications

Virtual
Counseling

Free Acute 
Medications

Members age 2 and older can connect
virtually with a provider within minutes for
diagnoses and work or school excuses.

Enjoy exclusive discounts on top services
like dental, vision, chiropractic, labs, and
home medical supplies. 

Virtual
Urgent Care

Dental, Vision, 
Chiropractic & More

Connect with a specialist for a second
opinion, suggestions, and the peace of
mind you deserve within 24 hours.

Concierge “subject matter” experts are
available and ready to offer support and
clarity whenever needed.

Message a 
Specialist

Healthcare
Advocacy

PLATINUM

CONCIERGE
HEALTHCARE


